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Bio

Zoe Lambert is a member of the firm’s Business Services Group. She 
advises clients on a range of transactional matters, including corporate 
governance, mergers and acquisitions, debt and equity financings, 
securities law compliance, and general commercial transactions.

Before joining the firm in her current role, Zoe gained hands-on 
experience with the Business Services Group as a summer associate at 
Drummond Woodsum. She also served as a transactional extern with 
Geiger, where she assisted with commercial contracts, and as a legal 
extern with IDEXX, supporting the company’s Commercial, Operations, 
Litigation, and Antitrust Group. These experiences gave Zoe valuable 
insight into the needs of businesses of all sizes, from local companies to 
large international organizations.

Zoe earned her J.D., cum laude, from the University of Maine School of 
Law, where she also received the Corporate Law Award and completed 
a Certificate in Business and Transactional Law. During law school, she 
authored a paper on the commercial and regulatory framework for tribal 
casinos, raising debt financing, reflecting her interest in complex 
financial structures. She received her B.S. in Criminal Justice, summa 
cum laude, from the University of Alabama.

She is awaiting admission to the Maine Bar.

Education

University of Maine School of Law, J.D., cum laude, Certificate in 
Business and Transactional Law (2025)

Practice Areas

Banking & Financial Services
Business & Corporate
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The University of Alabama, B.S., Criminal Justice, summa cum laude
(2020)

Recognition

Corporate Law Award, University of Maine School of Law


